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Hugo Garber who for nearly 30 years 
resided at Hugo, the little town north of 
Grants Pass, and which was named for him, 
died at the Palace hotel in this city Saturday 
morning, shortly after 11 o’clock.  Death 
was caused from Bright’s disease from 
which he has been a suffer for some months.

Mr. Garber was born in Hamburg, Germany, 
August 14, 1854, coming to this country 
over 30 years ago, most of this time being 
spent at Hugo.  He was unmarried and had 
no relatives in this country.  Two sisters and 
one brother live in Germany.

Hugo Garber was well known in Grants pass 
and throughout Josephine county.  Funeral 
services will be held at 2 o’clock Monday 
afternoon at Hall’s chapel on North Sixth 
street.  Interment will be in Granite Hill 
cemetery.

(From Monday’s Daily)

Hugo Garber, who died at the Palace hotel in 
this city Saturday was laid to rest in the 
Granite Hill cemetery this afternoon. 
Funeral services were held at Hall’s chapel 
on North Sixth street, where friends 
gathered with formal offerings.

A sister and a brother reside in Germany, the 
country from which Mr. Garber came over 
30 years ago.  He leaves no relatives in 
America.

Rev. William R. Jeffrey of the Newman M. 
E. church preached the funeral sermon at the 
chapel at 2 o’clock.

The dead man leaves property and money 
valued at about $5,000 and John Blalock has 
been appointed administrator.


